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Ballpoint pen drawing exercises

Written by Matt Fussell The Good Ole' ball point pen can be a great tool for drawing. Drawing with a ballpoint pen can create really good results. Although it is mostly used for fast sketches, more and more artists are using ballpoint pens for finished gallery quality art. Ballpoint pens are capable of producing comfortable
value losses. They also allow the artist to start quite loosely from the drawing and slowly become more detailed. This makes ballpoint pens a versatile tool for all kinds of topics, from portraits to still life and almost anything in between. Any marking technique can be used with ballpoint pens. You can use traditional pen
and ink techniques, such as hatching and crucify. Or you can use less traditional techniques such as mixing. Get access to all our courses today ... Just a dollar. Ballpoint pens can be used to draw on any surface that accepts a character. Mostly ballpoint pens are used on ordinary drawing paper. It seems that the
smoother the paper tooth, the better the control of the pen. You should probably try many different ballpoint pens to find the right brand for you. Also try both black ballpoint pens and blue ones. I've never seen other colors used in finished work, but that doesn't mean they can't be used. Perhaps the best part about using
ballpoint pens to draw is that they are inexpensive and easily accessible almost anywhere. DOWNLOAD VIDEO This course is for beginners and intermediate artists, with over 300 minutes of HD video tutorial and 178 pages of ebooks covering the true essence of drawing, including elements and principles of art, as well
as a variety of drawing media and techniques. (28 Modules) WATCH A COURSE LIKE THIS TUTORIAL? If so, join more than 36,000 people who receive tutorials and articles. PLUS you get 3 FREE COURSE VIDEOS AND E-BOOKS! Just click on the button below to add your name! Here are more art classes you
might like... DRAWING COURSES PAINTING COURSES DIGITAL COURSES FOR TEACHERS I don't think it's an exaggeration to say that every artist wants to create amazing drawings and paintings. We want to combine technical skills with creativity, communicate our unique vision and imagination – even if it's only a
five-minute sketch. Don't you agree? But before it is possible to create amazing works of art, we need to spend time on the basics. We simply cannot expect to pass on our ideas through a drawing without basic technical skills. That's why so many beginners unfortunately don't stop drawing until after about a dozen
unsuccessful attempts to capture a topic they like, but too complex for their level. However, there are a few things that are important enough, regardless of how simple or or The subject is. We need to practice and build our abilities with skill. Drawing is no different than that. Practice plays an important role in developing
ourselves as artists and should be a regular part of our operations – regardless of our current skill level. This article is devoted to short but effective drawing exercises that you can perform in just a few minutes each day. Musicians regularly practice their scales. A basketball player practices layups. We can think of these
exercises the same way. If you practice them regularly, your drawing skills will be greatly improved. Even if you are confident in the lines and hatching and satisfied with the results, these exercises are still a fun exercise. They offer the opportunity to focus your mind on simple concrete action that makes it easy to get into
the state of flow (or meditative immersion in the process). The results of a five- or 10-minute warm-up before you even touch on the big project you're working on can be surprising. Vocalists do various warm-ups before the actual performance. We can use these exercises in the same way – by warming the technical side
of our artistic brain. The training tool is up to you. It can be a graphite pen, ink lining, nib pen or any other marking tool. (I used ink linings just because they are my favorites; they offer clear, opposite and controlled marks on paper.) Paper can be whatever you want – plain print paper is great because it's as affordable
and you can use as many sheets as you like. I've created a special spreadsheet that includes a few templates to help you with the line drawing exercises below. Click the button below to download the PDF spreadsheet... Click here to get a spreadsheet that separates the usual lines from hatching There is no significant
difference between the standard line used as an outline and the hatch. Both are, after all, lines, but both have different purposes. Let's expand the musical theme and make some comparisons. I see the outline as a solo singer and a hatch – a member of the choir. They're both lines, but they play different roles. The line's
mission is to convey character and mood, and in some cases – to help the viewer distinguish the fore front from the background. They can report a light source in a scene. The lines become outlines of the drawing. They are a means of expression on their own. The hatch is part of a larger system that functions as a
whole. We can call this hatching (or crucifly hatching or hatching of contours, depending on the nature and interaction of the hatches). For the hatches to work together, they should be uniform. If some hatches break the visual pattern and attract too much viewer attention, the impression may not be as pleasant as we
wanted. The hatches are also when it comes to working on values and creating volume bias. See also: Hatching and cross-peeling Working linear muscles Drawing a line seems easy, but your mind and body work in union to perform this task successfully. There is a difference in how we create shorter and longer signs,
and the use of the right muscle is crucial. Take a sheet of paper and any tool. Draw a short line (about 1 cm is enough) and observe how your fingers work together, moving slightly holding the tool. Then draw a longer line (4-5 cm). You will notice that your wrist is activated to extend the line. Now create an even longer
character (such as 9-10 cm or more). This is possible thanks to the elbow muscles. Below you will find a picture with my lines (a – elbow line, b – wristline, c – fingers): I am sure you have understood the general idea of this exercise. Lines of different lengths require slightly different movements. Keep that in mind and pay
attention to body behavior, especially if you feel something is going wrong. Using the right muscle group provides the greatest control over your lines. I would say that wrist or elbow lines are most commonly used to create contours, while lines drawn by moving fingers are better suited for adding peeling and finer details.
Another tip is to find out which direction of hand movement is most appropriate for you: far from yourself or towards yourself. This varies from person to person, so I would say that trying both ways and forming your own conclusion is important. It's great if you make the signs look the same, ignoring the direction of the



hand movement. And the last tip of this section: check the surface that supports the paper. Possible dents, bumps or subtle texture can complicate consistent lines, if not impossible. Hairy lines It is perfectly normal to be careful when trying to draw a line that repeats the outline of the object you are observing. Especially if
you're an art novice. When you're too careful, you can draw a short line, then add another undescending line, and so on. The outline is a little hairy and messy. There are many tracks, but they look confusing or heavy. This is different from drawing a lot of lines quickly to find the proportions of the topic. In particular, we
deal with ready-made lines when we call them hairy. However, it is perfectly acceptable to start with looser, liquid lines in the early stages of drawing and refine the outline. If you want to develop more control of the finished lines, I recommend that you try to use as few lines as possible, which makes them as long and
streamy as possible. Free yourself from fear of failure, relax mind and hands. Trusting yourself is also a skill that can be developed! Maybe you don't draw contours right on your first attempt, but you'll get better with this skill over time. The more you practice, the better you get. Below you will find a picture of what I am
describing in this section. Now we're ready to start practicing! Exercise 1 – Drawing straight lines Focus on drawing straight lines with your free hand without a ruler. Note that the goal is to explore our abilities and nothing else! We're not trying to create perfect lines. If you're not sure about drawing a straight line, I
recommend outlining the ruler with a pencil ruler. This line should be barely visible because it serves as a reference. When drawing a line, pay attention to the pressure and speed of movement of the tool. Don't push too hard. You'll notice that the starting and ending points of the lines depend on how lightly you touch the
paper and how fast the tool moves. In the image below, you will find several lines: a – a line with cut (thick) start and end points. I call them full stop lines because you should slow down a little to make the heads look like this. b – a line with sharp start and end points. This character of the heads is achieved with a lighter,
faster movement. c – a line with a dense start and a light, sharp end. d – a line with a sharp start and a full stop at the end.  In order for your lines to run smoothly, I recommend repeating all four examples. Some are more natural to you and some require additional policies. Keep in the way that slowing down hand
movements too much can cause unwanted effects, especially on thin paper. For example, if you leave an ink lining in one place for several seconds, you can get a dark lump. It is therefore important to find a balance!  To make the exercise more interesting, you can try any tool that offers a different line width depending
on the pressure (such as nib pen or brush pen). Play with your tool and see how it behaves. Some drawing tools allow you to create a dramatic change to the line width. In the image below you will find my lines made with brush pen. I've created constant lines and also gaps. If you don't have a brush pen or nib pen, you
can use different shapes of the same tool. For example, you can use multiple ink or varying widths. It is likely that you will know your tools better and find out which one is most comfortable for you. Here are my lines created with 0.1, 0.3, and 0.4 bleeds... Exercise 2 – Draw lines with gaps Now we draw dashes. The
intervals can be the same or a touch of spontaneity. Exercise 3 – Control and precision exercise The next exercise is more advanced. First draw a line vertically it can be straight or moody curved. Then add the hatches - they should be located on or next to the side of this line. If you want to add a little more challenge to
this task, you can keep the hatches in a small time frame, just as far from the outline. Or you can draw another outline and make sure all the hatches end there. This exercise is good practice for increasing surveillance. Exercise 4 – Drawing a dotted line Now we create a dotted line – it may seem a little strange, but the
line can also consist of dots! And the ability to create comfortable dotted lines can be very useful in your creative process. The aim of the exercise is to find a nice rhythm. Observe how your hand moves, do not rush, and make sure you withdraw your hands quickly enough after each blessing. Each interest must have a
clear shape without a stained tail. A dotted line can be continuous (breaks are approximately equal) or irregular. Exercise 5 – Drawing Wavy and Zigzag lines Let's have fun with patterned lines like wavy and zigzag lines (but feel free to draw other lines you like). You can create borders by outlining a couple of horizontal
lines and adding lines to them. In the photo below, you'll notice how my lines touch boundaries. Do not strive for absolute perfection – the goal is the same as in the previous exercise; find a nice rhythm and balance in movements. Exercise 6 – Scriling drawing with precise control is important, but drawing looser and less
precise lines is also an important skill to develop. Next, we take a break from drawing straight lines and relax with scratches. There's no right way or wrong way to do it. Let your hands move and throw all expectations aside. Exercise 7 – Developing precision skills The following exercises are dedicated to hatching and
cross-hatching. It is useful to train the eyes and hand to place new hatches in the openings of existing ones, not on top of them. To practice this skill, we create a color scheme, as shown in the photo below: This image can feel confusing – so where should we start? First of all, we need a rectangular shape divided into
three parts (such as three e lengthy rectangles side by side). I drew a three-part rectangular model with a graphite pen and hatching is done with ink mountains. Borders help us distinguish between hatch groups: the longest, medium and short. We start with the longest vertical hatches and fill the color models. There
should be some intervals between the hatches – don't pull them too close to each other. Then add shorter hatches (medium hatches). Finally, the shortest hatch is added – they should only be a third of the total Below is a step-by-step process to complete this exercise.  To make the task a little more complicated, repeat
this exercise with stale lines. The order in which the hatches are inserted is the same (the longest characters are added first). Exercise 8 – Basic steam training You can practice hatching with small squares/circles/rectangles that come to the edges of the hatches, or just go into it without limits at all. Each color you hatch
should have a uniform look and all hatches should flow in the same direction. The hatches can be horizontal, vertical or sning to any degree. You can start drawing slowly, and then create a new set of lines that moves faster and faster. However, the speed of drawing is not the focus of this exercise. Exercise 9 – Cross
Hatching Practice This exercise is a continuation of the previous one. This time we create one layer of hatching and cover it with another with signs in different directions. The hatches cross off, and we get the cross-hatching. If you like this exercise, I recommend coming up with as many examples and combinations as
possible. In addition, you can try different tools (multiple linings that offer different line widths) and analyze the effects obtained. Lesson 10 – Creating a scale of values with a cross-peeling value is the darkness or stability of the color. Value is incredibly important in creating the illusion of light, volume and texture in the
drawing. It is important to practice creating a full range of values with cross-peeling. In the 10th exercise, we create a scale of values with the help of a cross bone. The rectangular shape as a temple is useful. It does not need to be made too long (a length of 9-12 cm is enough). You can also think in advance about how
much space you need to create each value. A small amount of space is enough. The completion process of this exercise is as follows: Fill the entire shape with vertical hatches. Add the sloping hatching. Add a sloping hatching layer (this time in a different direction). Add horizontal hatching. Vertical hatches again, trying
to fill in the gaps. Sloping hatching again. You can see a repeating pattern. The goal is to create a comfortable, smooth transition from lighter value to darker. However, if some of your hatches look a little uneven, don't be discouraged. We want the signs to look like man made them – not a machine. The cross-peeling
scale may look like this: A spreadsheet that I've compiled that helps you practice. You can download it and print it so you can practice these exercises whenever you want. Click here for a spreadsheet creative approach to line training I hope you enjoy the practice. These exercises are more intense than they might seem.
But don't limit your training to just these exercises. Enter go wild and come up with your own warm-ups and challenges. Even the smallest exercise takes your art skills much further! A lot of people like it pretty much when they're on the phone or waiting. Take advantage of every available moment. Doodling's counting!
Here are a couple of my... Thoughtful exercise Before you finish this lesson, I'd like to add one more point on how you approach your daily drawing policy. It's totally OK to love doing things that are good. But sometimes we avoid activities that feel challenging or mundane. We are often attached to our strengths, avoiding
anything that makes us feel awkward or uncomfortable. On the other hand, developing already skills can make us even stronger. But anything of value in life sometimes requires attentive some weaknesses that prevent us from advancing with our skills (and all our amazing projects). Art is no exception. Let me give you
an example. If an artist feels that their drawings are not as strong as they could be because of undecided lines and inaccurate hatching, avoiding this weak spot will not improve their skills. They should spend some time practicing – that's really the only way to improve. If you know what to improve and how to practice,
your success is a matter of time and effort. All magic takes place while you work and enjoy the process, even if there are challenges. Don't be afraid to leave your comfort zone. The area.
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